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Abstract 

The state is an important presence in the lives of many minority families. This 
special issue aims to investigate the interactions of minority families with law and state 
institutions from a socio-legal perspective, with a particular focus on issues relating to 
children. This introduction focuses on two observations. First of all, minority families 
tend to get into contact with law and state institutions relatively often. For migrant and 
transnational families, migration law can have a large and enduring impact on many 
aspects of their lives. Furthermore, marginalisation of minorities and differences in 
decision-making by state actors can contribute to an overrepresentation of minority 
families in state interventions such as the child protection or criminal justice systems. 
Secondly some minority families tend to avoid state law and institutions. Especially in 
family matters such as marriage or divorce, minority family members may look for 
alternative options outside of the state, concluding religious marriages or divorces. 
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Resumen 

El Estado es una presencia importante en las vidas de muchas familias de 
minorías. Este número especial pretende investigar las interacciones de las familias de 
minorías con las leyes y las instituciones estatales desde una perspectiva socio-jurídica, 
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con especial atención a los temas relacionados con niños. Esta introducción se centra en 
dos observaciones. En primer lugar, las familias de minorías tienden a entrar en contacto 
con las leyes y las instituciones estatales con relativa frecuencia. Para familias migrantes 
y transnacionales, la marginalización de las minorías y las diferencias en la toma de 
decisiones de agentes estatales puede contribuir a una sobrerrepresentación de las 
familias de minorías en intervenciones estatales como la prostitución infantil o los 
sistemas de justicia penal. En segundo lugar, algunas familias de minorías tienden a 
eludir las leyes y las instituciones estatales. Especialmente en asuntos familiares como el 
matrimonio y el divorcio, los miembros de familias de minorías pueden buscar opciones 
alternativas fuera del Estado, como matrimonios y divorcios religiosos. 
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1. Introduction 

In the last decennia, European families have become increasingly diverse. This diversity 
has posed challenges to policymakers and state institutions. This special issue aims to 
investigate the interactions of minority families with law and state institutions from a 
socio-legal perspective, with a particular focus on issues relating to children. The state is 
an important presence in the lives of many minority families, particularly migrants and 
transnational families. The state categorises people, demands obligations, gives rights, 
and provides services (Feldman-Savelsberg 2016). The religious, cultural, or ethnic 
identity of children can play a role in a wide range of contexts, including education; child 
welfare and protection systems; migration and naturalisation services; family law 
matters; as well as in the courts. This special issue is the result of a workshop at the Oñati 
International Institute for the Sociology of Law in 2019, entitled Minority families and the 
law. Interactions of ethnic, religious, and cultural minorities with law and state institutions. All 
of the contributions in this special issue were presented at this workshop.  

This introduction will depart from two observations, based on a comparative reading of 
the contributions. First of all, minority families tend get into contact with law and state 
institutions relatively often. Specifically for migrant and transnational families, 
migration law can have a large and enduring impact on many aspects of their lives. 
Furthermore, marginalisation of minorities as well as differences in decision-making by 
state actors can contribute to an overrepresentation of minority families in state 
interventions such as the child protection and criminal law systems. Secondly, possibly 
as a consequence of this first observation, some minority families tend to avoid state law 
and institutions. Especially in family matters such as marriage or divorce, minority 
family members may look for alternative options outside of the state, such as religious 
marriages or divorces. 

2. Minority families and migration law 

Migration law status has an impact on many aspects of the lives of migrants and 
transnational families, as well as on their interactions with the state, for example with 
regard to welfare, housing, education, and the ability to share life with family members. 
Particularly for those living with precarious legal statuses, living in reception centres, or 
relying on the state for welfare, “the law is all over” (Sarat 1990). From research on 
migration and asylum procedures it is clear that such procedures can have a large and 
enduring impact on the lives of migrants and their families, especially when people have 
been involved in prolonged and contentious legal procedures or have been living with 
irregular or precarious legal statuses (Coutin 2003, Charsley 2005, Gleeson 2010, Abrego 
2011, Kubal 2014, Shinozaki 2015, Menjívar and Lakhani 2016, Feldman-Savelsberg 2017, 
Sportel 2016, Sportel et al. 2019, Andrikopoulos 2021, de Hart and Besselsen 2021, 
Griffiths 2021). Alqawasmi’s contribution to this special issue also shows the importance 
of a migration law status for future dealings with the state. For people without valid 
residence permits or papers, it was often not possible to conduct a civil marriage in Italy, 
which was one of the reasons Muslims in Alqawasmi’s study opted for a religious 
marriage at an Islamic centre.   

In this special issue, Hiitola’s contribution demonstrates the profound impact migration 
law has on young forced migrants living in Finland. Most of the young people she 
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interviewed came as unaccompanied minors to Finland. Strict Finnish family 
reunification policies meant that for many of them it was impossible to bring family 
members to the country. Living separately from family members and worrying for their 
safety abroad had a large impact on the young migrants’ wellbeing. The young people 
Hiitola interviewed had a strong wish to be independent and to provide for their 
transnational family members, at an age where many young people in Europe still 
depend on their parents. Hiitola links this strong sense of wanting to be independent to 
these young people’s experiences of dependency on the state, due to living in state 
systems as minors as well as the lack of control over migration procedures. Hiitola uses 
the concept of “everyday security” to shed light on the material, interpersonal, and 
existential (in)securities these young forced migrants experience. Although migration 
regimes made it impossible for most young migrants to live in the same country as their 
family, transnational family ties and even memories of family life were an important 
source of security in their lives.  

In Mustasaari’s contribution on ISIS-families, the ability of the state to control who enters 
and lives in its territories is also paramount. While the women and children at the centre 
of the debates she analysed are Finnish nationals, and therefore not subject to migration 
law, their imprisonment in the Al-Hol camp in Syria means they cannot return to Finland 
without the agreement and aid of the state.  

3. Encounters with the state 

Marginalised minorities are more like to come into contact with state institutions, for 
example with regard to welfare, housing, child protection, education, healthcare, or the 
criminal justice system (Malheiros 2002, Vinnerljung et al. 2008, Walker 2008, Blom et al. 
2016, Petintseva 2018, Webster 2018, Leerkes et al. 2019). These encounters with the state 
(Jones 2012) can be characterised by processes of inclusion and exclusion, in which issues 
like securitisation (Ragazzi 2016), belonging (Mustasaari 2021, this special issue), or 
discrimination can play a role. In Mustasaari’s contribution to this special issue, she 
analyses the role of affective constructions of justice in the Finnish public debates on 
ISIS-families. Mustasaari suggests there is a “connection between the way in which the 
women and children in Al-Hol are depicted as undeserving of basic fundamental rights 
and the process through which ethnic minority families in Finland become further 
ethnicized and racialized” (Mustasaari 2021, this special issue, p. 1041). Building on the 
work of Yuval-Davis, Wemyss, and Cassidy (2019) on bordering as an affective practice, 
Mustasaari shows how, despite being Finnish and white, in these debates the ISIS-
families are excluded from belonging to the Finnish nation and are recast as foreign and 
dangerous subjects.  

Fresnoza-Flot’s contribution on Filipino mothers and divorce analyses how these 
mothers deal with law and state institutions concerning their children during divorce. 
Fresnoza-Flot states that separating mixed couples with children are more exposed to 
socio-legal challenges during divorce processes compared to their counterparts in non-
mixed families. This “also implies the inevitability of the encounters of these couples 
with legal institutions or entities and the intersectionality of divorce’s implications on 
their lives.” (Fresnoza-Flot 2021, this special issue, p. 995). The transnational dimension 
of the encounters with state institutions sets these Filipino mothers apart from mothers 
in non-mixed divorced families. Fresnoza-Flot also found that mothers with younger 
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children as well as with more conflictual divorces had more encounters with state 
institutions. At the same time, however, some mothers avoided interacting with state 
institutions or claiming rights. This will be further discussed below.  

My own contribution to this special issue deals with ethnic, religious, or cultural claims 
made by minority family members in court cases against state institutions in the 
Netherlands. In the literature on courts and minority families, such claims are often 
discussed in the context of the so-called cultural defence, where perpetrators of crimes 
make cultural claims to avoid or lessen punishment. However, as I show in this 
contribution, family members do not just make such claims to defend themselves. They 
can also demand exceptions of state policies, accommodation of particular practices, or 
to challenge discrimination by state institutions. By analysing claims-making as a 
performative practice of persuasion (Zivi 2011) I show how Dutch courts are often 
reluctant to engage with such claims, and tend to leave them out of court judgements 
entirely. I argue that this lack of engagement – or downright dismissal – should be 
understood in the context of general Dutch discourses of colour-blindness and of 
assimilation and integration of migrant minorities.  

4. Avoiding the state 

While marginalised and migrant minorities tend to have more contact with state 
institutions, at the same time – and possibly as a consequence of these involuntary 
encounters with the state – some minority families tend to avoid state law and 
institutions such as the courts. There is a rich literature on alternative dispute resolution 
by minority groups, especially in contexts of migration and post-colonialism. A 
substantial part of this literature focuses on Muslim minorities in the UK (for example: 
Bano 2007, 2012, Keshavjee 2007, Tas 2013, Akhtar 2013, Bowen 2016, Jones 2020), and to 
a lesser extent in other European countries such as the Netherlands, Germany, and the 
Nordic countries (van Rossum 1999, Al-Sharmani 2017, Rohe 2018, Jaraba 2020). 
Religious or culturally-based conflict-resolution outside of the state is often viewed with 
suspicion by European state actors, as well as in public debates, especially when it 
considers Muslim minorities (Jones and Shanneik, 2020). For example, in the past 
decade, several European countries have commissioned research to investigate “parallel 
justice” practices of Muslims, such as in the UK (Siddiqui et al. 2018); the Netherlands 
(Bakker et al. 2010); and Germany (Rohe and Jaraba 2015).  

However, as the contributions to this special issue show, there are many different 
reasons for minority family members to arrange family matters outside of state 
institutions. As Alqawasmi found in her research on Islamic centres in Italy, Muslim 
institutions lack an agreement with the state as other denominations in Italy have. This 
means that if Muslims in Italy want a legally valid marriage, they need to conduct a civil 
marriage, which can be followed by a religious marriage at an Islamic centre. Different 
from other religious groups, there is no option to conclude a state-sanctioned, religiously 
valid marriage. As Alqawasmi found, some couples choose to conduct religious 
marriages without a civil marriage. Such informal marriages are not necessarily 
motivated by cultural or religious reasons. For example, as some people in Alqawasmi’s 
study did not have a valid residence permit or the necessary papers to conduct a civil 
marriage, they turned to the Islamic centres to get married. As Alqawasmi points out, 
conducting a religious marriage without a civil marriage also means that there are no 
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options to resort to state courts to divorce or to claim maintenance or property rights if 
the marriage breaks down, which means mediation by religious centres might be their 
only option for dispute resolution. 

Fresnoza-Flot’s study on Filipino women in transnational relationships and divorce also 
shows that some of the mothers she interviewed in Belgium were reluctant to use state 
institutions to claim child maintenance and other financial benefits from their former 
partner. These mothers described negative social images in Belgium on Filipino women 
as being in relationships only for economic purposes or even being “bought” by their 
Belgian husbands. To counter such images, these mothers refused to start court 
procedures to claim the financial benefits they were entitled to, opting instead to work 
more and make ends meet to maintain their children themselves. Fresnoza-Flot did not 
encounter these arguments with interviewees living in the Netherlands. Rather, when 
some Filipino mothers in the Netherlands were reluctant to claim child maintenance, 
Dutch social workers urged them to make these claims, in the best interest of their 
children.    

5. Aims of the special issue 

This special issue aims to investigate interactions of minority families with law and state 
institutions from a socio-legal perspective, with a particular focus on issues relating to 
children. Thus far, different aspects of minority families’ interactions with law and state 
institutions tend to be studied in different academic fields, which hardly ever meet. For 
example, studies on structural inequalities in the outcomes of decision-making in child 
protective services or the youth criminal system regarding with minority children are 
largely disconnected from studies of courts and state institutions dealing with claims 
made by migrant and religious minorities. Similarly, studies on minority language or 
religious education, on migrant parents’ interactions with parenting services in big cities, 
or transnational families, all take place in different disciplines. This special issue aims to 
overcome such disciplinary limitations by including contributions from different 
disciplinary and national backgrounds, including law; migration, diaspora, and 
transnational families; sociology; socio-legal studies; anthropology; and gender and 
ethnicity studies. 

Furthermore, the special issue aims to examine intersections of religion, ethnicity, and 
culture to better understand variations in the positioning of various minorities vis-à-vis 
state actors. How does the positioning of minorities in different European countries 
influence their experiences with law and state institutions? How does ethnic background 
or migration/residence status impact on family members’ encounters with the state? 
How do multiple interactions with state institutions shape minority family life?  

This special issue draws on case studies from different types of minorities, including 
migrant and post-colonial but also religious minorities, from a range of different 
countries, which will give further insights in intersections of ethnicity, culture, 
nationality, and religion The contributions to this special issue come from different 
European countries, and focus on different minorities. This rich diversity enables this 
special issue to compare and analyse encounters of minority families with the state 
across different contexts. There are contributions on Finland (Mustasaari, Hiitola), 
Belgium (Fresnoza-Flot), the Netherlands (Fresnoza-Flot, Sportel), and Italy 
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(Alqawasmi); on Muslims (Alqawasmi), ISIS-families (Mustasaari), young forced 
migrants (Hiitola), Filipino mothers (Fresnoza-Flot), and various religious, cultural, and 
ethnic minorities (Sportel). The authors also approach the topic from different angles: 
public and political debates (Mustasaari), Imams and religious centres (Alqawasmi), 
courts (Sportel), and people getting into contact with these institutions (Fresnoza-Flot, 
Hiitola, Alqawasmi).  
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